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Premature Menopause Linked to Increased Musculoskeletal Pain and Likelihood of Sarcopenia 

New study underscores the potential significance of hormone levels in influencing musculoskeletal health 
during the postmenopause phase 

 
CLEVELAND, Ohio (May 1, 2024)—Musculoskeletal pain is a prevalent menopause symptom, which 
helps explain why women typically experience more pain than men, especially around the age of 50 
years. Beyond pain, muscle function and mass are also affected by menopause. A new study suggests 
premature surgical menopause can lead to an increased risk of muscle disorders. Results of the survey are 
published online today in Menopause, the journal of The Menopause Society. 
 
The highly publicized Study of Women’s Health Across the Nation spotlighted a number of symptoms 
that are common during the menopause transition. Among other findings, it confirmed that muscle 
stiffness complaints were most prevalent during menopause, affecting 54% of US women aged 40 to 55 
years. 
 
This is also the time when ovarian hormone levels decrease significantly. In women who have 
experienced premature menopause, either spontaneous or surgical, the decrease is even more prominent. 
In addition, testosterone levels have also been shown to fall significantly in women with premature 
menopause. 
 
These facts led researchers to conduct a new study specifically designed to evaluate the effect of different 
types of menopause on muscle discomfort and function in late-postmenopausal women aged 55 years and 
older. The study, which included nearly 650 women, concluded that women experiencing premature 
surgical menopause were more likely to develop musculoskeletal discomfort and sarcopenia than those 
with natural menopause at age 45 years or older. They theorized that the pain and decline in muscle mass 
in the late-postmenopause stage was more closely linked to hormone deficiency than to chronologic age 
alone. 
 
Survey results are published in the article “Association of muscle disorders in late postmenopausal 
women according to the type of experienced menopause.” 
 
“This study highlights the potential long-term musculoskeletal effects of premature surgical menopause, 
which causes a more abrupt and complete loss of ovarian hormones, including estrogen and testosterone, 
than natural menopause. The use of hormone therapy until the natural age of menopause has the potential 
to mitigate some of the adverse long-term effects of early estrogen loss,” says Dr. Stephanie Faubion, 
medical director for The Menopause Society. 
 
For more information about menopause and healthy aging, visit www.menopause.org. 
 
The Menopause Society (formerly The North American Menopause Society) is dedicated to empowering 
healthcare professionals and providing them with the tools and resources to improve the health of women 

 



during the menopause transition and beyond. As the leading authority on menopause since 1989, the 
nonprofit, multidisciplinary organization serves as the independent, evidence-based resource for 
healthcare professionals, researchers, the media, and the public and leads the conversation about 
improving women’s health and healthcare experiences. To learn more, visit menopause.org. 


