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Diets High in N-3 Polyunsaturated Fats May Help Decrease Risk of Breast Cancer 

 
A new study evaluates associations between breast cancer risk and intake of n-3 polyunsaturated fatty 

acids, based on menopause status 

 

CLEVELAND, Ohio (July 27, 2022)—Diet has long been reported to potentially affect breast cancer risk. 
Growing evidence suggests that n-3 polyunsaturated fatty acids (PUFAs) may play a role in the 
pathogenesis of breast cancer. A new study documents an inverse association between breast cancer risk 
and n-3 PUFA consumption, especially in premenopausal women who are obese. Study results are 
published online today in Menopause, the journal of The North American Menopause Society (NAMS). 
 
Breast cancer is by far the most common malignant tumor in women worldwide, so it’s little wonder that 
so many studies focus on ways to limit the risk of this highly prevalent disease. Previous studies have 
been conducted to investigate the association of n-3 PUFAs with breast cancer risk but have shown mixed 
results. Many of these studies were performed only in postmenopausal women because the peak age for 
breast cancer is 60 to 70 years in western countries, whereas it is age 40 to 50 years in Asian countries. 
 
In this latest hospital-based, case-control study including nearly 1,600 cases, researchers not only 
examined the association between the intake of n-3 PUFAs in general with breast cancer, but they also 
looked at the effect of individual n-3 PUFAs. Good sources of n-3 PUFAs include fish, vegetable oil, nuts 
(especially walnuts), flax seeds and flaxseed oil, and leafy vegetables. Because the human body does not 
produce n-3 fatty acids naturally, these food sources are essential. In addition, researchers also examined 
whether the association was modified by menopause status, hormone-receptor status, or linoleic acid 
intake. 
 
The study concluded that a higher intake of marine n-3 PUFAs and total n-3 PUFAs was associated with 
a lower risk of breast cancer. Dietary a-linolenic acid, eicosapentaenoic acid, docosapentaenoic acid, and 
docosahexaenoic acid also were inversely associated with breast cancer risk. Such inverse associations 
were more evident in premenopausal women and women with certain types of breast tumors. In addition, 
a decreased risk of breast cancer was significantly associated with increasing n-3 PUFA intake in women 
who were overweight or obese but not in women of normal weight. There was a significant interaction 
between linoleic acid and marine n-3 PUFAs. 
 
Study results are published in the article “Association of dietary intake of n-3 polyunsaturated fatty acids 
with breast cancer risk in pre- and postmenopausal Chinese women.” 
 
“This study highlights the effect of lifestyle habits and, specifically, dietary intake of polyunsaturated 
fatty acids on breast cancer risk. Lifestyle (or diet) is known to contribute to up to one-third of the risk for 
breast cancer. Women can affect their risk of developing breast cancer by making dietary changes to 

 



include fruits and vegetables, fiber, and whole grains and avoiding high-fat animal and dairy products,” 
says Dr. Chrisandra Shufelt, NAMS president.  
 
For more information about menopause and healthy aging, visit www.menopause.org. 
 
Founded in 1989, The North American Menopause Society (NAMS) is North America’s leading 
nonprofit organization dedicated to promoting the health and quality of life of all women during midlife 
and beyond through an understanding of menopause and healthy aging. Its multidisciplinary membership 
of 2,000 leaders in the field—including clinical and basic science experts from medicine, nursing, 
sociology, psychology, nutrition, anthropology, epidemiology, pharmacy, and education—makes NAMS 
uniquely qualified to serve as the definitive resource for health professionals and the public for accurate, 
unbiased information about menopause and healthy aging. To learn more about NAMS, 
viswww.menopause.org. 
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